
LISD School Health Advisory Council 
September 28, 2016 

 
 

Agenda Item:    ​Discussion: Action: Follow Up By/Date: 

Call to Order 
 
 
Introductions 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Review of Minutes  
For May 4, 2016 

Chairperson Dr. Michelle Martz 
at  7:15p 
 
 
All attendees introduced 
themselves and shared their 
motivation for participating on 
this committee. 
 
 
Minutes from last meeting 
were approved.  

 
 
 
Think about what 
subcommittee you want to 
serve on. 
 
 
 
Meeting dates for the year: 
 
Nov 16, 2016 
Feb 8, 2017 
April 5, 2017 
Make-up date May 3, 2017 

Next Meeting on Nov 16th 
 
 
Notify members via email of 
participation intentions before 
next meeting on Nov 16th 

OLD BUSINESS 
 
 
 

Brief history of what the 
committee had addressed and 
considered ​by Melanie 
Vincelette 
2008-11 - Human Sexuality 
2011 - Abstinence  
           (180 Degrees) 
           Child’s Nutrition 
           Partnership w/ Dairy 

 No action required. 



            Max & NFL 
2013 - Obesity > 
            Healthy Zone grants 
            Learning Labs HB987 
2014 - Childhood Obesity  
           21 Day Challenge 
            Revision of Wellness 
            Plan 
2015 -Coordinated School 
           Health programs 
           SPARK 
           CATCH 
           Review Wellness Plan 
  

NEW BUSINESS 
 
 

Two possible topics to focus 
on for the 2016-17 year: 

1. Employee Wellness 
2. Mental Health of 

Students - 
a. Need to have a 

course in place 
and resources 

b. Need to have a 
plan for 
intervening 

 
Monya Crow, Director of 
Guidance & Counseling, 
reported on concerns about 
mental health intervention​ ​and 

 Members will receive an email 
asking to select a 
sub-committee to serve on 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
No action required. 
 
 
 
 



programs already in place at 
LISD. 
 
Carin Shearer, SPED Director, 
explained policies and 
procedures regarding  a 
student outcry. 
 
Alisha McDonald, Aramark 
General Manager, gave a 
summary of the Wellness 
Policy with mandates by 
USDA. 
 
Melanie Vincelette, Director of 
Health Services, spoke about 
the AED program and a recent 
rescue using an AED.  
 

 
 
 
 
No action required. 
 
 
 
 
No action required. 
 
 
 
 
 
No action required. 

Adjourned 
 

Adjourned at 8:10p 
Next meeting will be at 7:00p 
on Nov. 16th 

  

 


