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Fujitsu T4010D - Centrino 1.6Ghz, 512mb, 60GB, 802.11b/g, 12" TFT,
DVD/CD-RW, two USB 2.0, Firewire, SD slot, 3 YR Warranty $1.962.77 $1,831.00 $2,108.00
Kensington Microsaver Security Cable included included included
Targus Notebook Case included included included
128MB USB Flash Drive included no bid included
S-Video Solution - USB/PS2 $75.06 $93.00 $87.00
4-in-1 adapter included $30.45 no bid
Port Replicator $121.38 $124.95 $132.00
Bay Battery $114.24 $117.60 $125.00
AC Adapter $40.00 $38.85 $41.00
USB Floppy Drive $40.00 $38.85 $41.00
EMR Pen $40.00 no bid $41.00
Additional 2 year warranty no bid no bid no bid
Acer Travelmate C302XCI - Centrino 1.6Ghz, 512MB, 60GB, 802.11b/g,
14.1" TFT, DVD/CD-RW, two USB 2.0, FireWire, S-video, FIR, 3 YR $1,795.00( $1,945.00 $1,796.00 $1,949.28
Warranty
Kensington Microsaver Security Cable included included included| included
Targus Notebook Case included included included| included
128MB USB Flash Drive included no bid included| included
Port Replicator $95.00 $90.57 $106.00 $90.82
Bay Battery $123.00 $132.00 $126.00( $134.16
AC Adapter $49.00 $36.75 $59.00 $49.99
USB Floppy Drive $37.00 $38.85 $49.00 $50.53
Full Size EMR Pen $49.00 no bid $49.00 $45.77
Additional 2 year warranty no bid no bid included
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Acer Travelmate C303XMI - Centrino 1.7Ghz, 1GB, 80GB, 802.11b/g,
14.1" XGA, DVD multi drive, two USB 2.0, FireWire, S-video, FIR, 4-in-1
card reader, 3 YR Warranty $2,503.64 $2,219.00 $2,236.00
Kensington Microsaver Security Cable included included included
Targus Notebook Case no bid included included
128MB USB Flash Drive included included included
Port Replicator $115.34 $95.00 $106.00
Bay Battery $135.97 $123.00 $126.00
AC Adapter no bid $49.00 $59.00
USB Floppy Drive $62.96 $37.00 $49.00
Full Size EMR Pen $56.66 $49.00 $49.00
Additional 2 year warranty included no bid included
Acer Travelmate C112TCi - Centrino 1.1Ghz, 512GB, 60GB, 802.11b/g,
10.4" XGA, external CD-RW/DVD drive, two USB 2.0, FireWire, FIR, 3 YR
Warranty $1,696.00
Kensington Microsaver Security Cable included
Targus Notebook Case included
128MB USB Flash Drive included
Port Replicator $106.00
Bay Battery $126.00
AC Adapter $59.00
USB Floppy Drive $49.00
Full Size EMR Pen $49.00
Additional 2 year warranty included
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Toshiba Portege M200 - Centrino 1.6Ghz, 512MB, 60GB, 802.11b/g, 12.1"
SXGA, external CD-RW/DVD, two USB 2.0, IR, 3 YR Warranty $2,082.00 $1,896.00
Kensington Microsaver Security Cable included included
Targus Notebook Case included included
128MB USB Flash Drive included included
Port Replicator $101.00 $109.00
Bay Battery $98.00 $119.00
AC Adapter $67.00 $79.00
USB Floppy Drive $31.00 $39.00
Full Size EMR Pen $29.00 $39.00
Additional 2 year warranty no bid no bid
Compag tc1100 - Centrino 1.1Ghz, 512MB, 60GB, 802.11b/g, 10.4" TFT,
external CD-RW/DVD, two USB 2.0, FIR, 3 YR Warranty $2,027.00
Kensington Microsaver Security Cable included
Targus Notebook Case included
128MB USB Flash Drive included
Port Replicator $199.00
Bay Battery $106.00
AC Adapter $41.00
USB Floppy Drive $28.00
Full Size EMR Pen $41.00
Additional 2 year warranty no bid
Motion M1400 - Centrino 1.1Ghz, 512MB, 60GB, 802.11b/g, 12.1" TFT,
two USB 2.0, FireWire, FIR, 3 YR Warranty $2,207.00
Kensington Microsaver Security Cable included
Targus Notebook Case included
128MB USB Flash Drive no bid
Port Replicator no bid
Bay Battery no bid
AC Adapter no bid
USB Floppy Drive no bid
Full Size EMR Pen no bid
Additional 2 year warranty no bid
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Viewsonic 1250 - Centrino 1.0Ghz, 512MB, 60GB, 802.11b/g, 12.1" TFT,
two USB 2.0, FireWire, 3 YR Warranty $1,896.00
Kensington Microsaver Security Cable included
Targus Notebook Case included
128MB USB Flash Drive included
Port Replicator $159.00
Bay Battery $89.00
AC Adapter no bid
USB Floppy Drive $49.00
Full Size EMR Pen $39.00
Additional 2 year warranty no bid

Gateway M275E - Centrino 1.75Ghz, 512MB, 60GB, 802.11b/g, 12.1" TFT,

CD-RW/DVD, two USB 2.0, FireWire, 4-in-one card reader, 3 YR Warranty $1.796.00
Kensington Microsaver Security Cable included
Targus Notebook Case included
128MB USB Flash Drive included
Port Replicator $129.00

Bay Battery $129.00
AC Adapter $49.00
USB Floppy Drive $59.00
Full Size EMR Pen $29.00
Additional 2 year warranty included
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DELL 1700 Laser Printer - 25ppm, 16MB $ 196.10
Toner Cartridge - 3K $ 65.99
Toner Cartridge - 6K $ 87.99
USB printer cable included
DELL 1700N Laser Printer - 25ppm, 32MB $ 278.78
Toner Cartridge - 3K $ 65.99
Toner Cartridge - 6K $ 87.99
USB printer cable included
DELL 3100CN Color Laser Printer - 25ppm/5ppm, 64MB $ 563.92
Toner Cartridge Black - 4K $ 46.40
Toner Cartridge Cyan - 2K $ 67.03
Toner Cartridge Magenta - 2K $ 67.03
Toner Cartridge Yellow - 2K $ 67.03
USB printer cable included
DELL 5100CN Color Laser Printer - 35ppm/25ppm, 128MB $ 996.40
Toner Cartridge Black - 9K $ 49.01
Toner Cartridge Cyan - 8K $ 166.71
Toner Cartridge Magenta - 8K $ 166.71
Toner Cartridge Yellow - 8K $ 166.71
USB printer cable included
HP LaserJet 2300dtn - 25ppm, 48MB $1,173.47
Toner Cartridge - 6K no bid
USB printer cable no bid
HP LaserJet 4250N - 45pp, 64MB $ 873.00 $1,115.00 $ 859.00
Toner Cartridge - 12K no bid $ 125.00 $ 129.00
USB printer cable included $ 3.00 included
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Lanier LP026n Laser Printer - 26ppm, 64MB - 1st 500 $ 280.00
Unit price after 1st 500 $ 399.00
Toner Cartridge - 15K $ 178.13
USB printer cable included
Lexmark E330 - 27ppm, 32MB $ 359.82
Toner Cartridge no bid
USB printer cable included
Okidata B6100 Laser Printer - 26ppm, 64MB $ 628.39
Toner Cartridge - 15K $ 137.52
USB printer cable $ 12.00
Ricoh AP400 - 26ppm, 64MB $ 498.50
Toner Cartridge no bid
USB printer cable $ 1.75
Xerox Phaser 3130/B - 17ppm, 32MB $ 236.00
Toner Cartridge - 5K $ 65.45
USB printer cable included
Xerox Phaser 3450/DN - 25ppm, 32MB $ 399.00 $ 526.00 | $ 463.00
Toner Cartridge - 5K $ 112.40 $ 122.00 | $ 117.54
Toner Cartridge - 10K no bid no bid [ $ 180.84
32MB Upgrade $ 53.12 $ 61.00 no bid
USB printer cable $ 340 no bid | included
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