
LISD QUOTE # 280-04 INFRASTRUCTURE CABLING PARTS
TABULATION

Brand Name/Description Part Number CDW-G CABLE 
PLUS

DATA 
OPTICS

MICRO 
SYSTEMS

QA

Cable - CATVE Plenum 2451-COM  NO BID  $     0.134  $     0.141  $     0.159  $     0.140 
Cable - CATVE Plenum, Shielded 2648-COM  NO BID  $     0.310  $     0.330  $     0.488  $     0.320 
Cable - CATIII 25 Pair Plenum Please provide  NO BID  $     0.390  $     0.420  $     0.412  $     0.370 
Fiber Wire, Plenum, 8 strand, breakout, 62.5/125, Multi-Mode BX08-085K-W-P  NO BID  $     1.460  $     1.540  $     1.588  $     1.350 
Fiber Wire, Plenum, 4 strand, breakout, Single-Mode Please provide  NO BID  $     0.510  $     0.540  $     0.576  $     0.430 
3' Patch Cables, rj45, 10/100bt,pvc,CATVe PC8A03F-L5EB  NO BID  $     0.750  $     0.800  $     1.710  $     1.440 
7' Patch Cables, rj45, 10/100bt, pvc, CATVe PC8A07F-L5EB  NO BID  $     1.500  $     1.600  $     2.870  $     2.450 
15' Patch Cables, rj45, 10/100bt, pvc, CATVe PC8A15F-L5EB  NO BID  $     2.000  $     2.100  $     4.240  $     4.350 
25' Patch Cables, rj45, 10/100bt, pvc, CATVe PC8A25F-L5EB  NO BID  $     2.350  $     2.500  $     6.180  $     7.250 
15' Fiber Patch Cables - ST Please provide  NO BID  $   11.250  $   11.850  $   37.470  $   12.670 

Face Plates, Leviton - 6 POS 42080-6WS  NO BID  $     1.050  $     1.110  $     1.180  $     1.150 

Face Plates, Leviton - 4 POS 42080-4WS  $       1.99  $     1.050  $     1.110  $     1.180  $     1.150 

Face Plates, Leviton - 3 POS 42080-3WS  $       5.80  $     1.050  $     1.110  $     1.180  $     1.150 
Single Insert Modules, Leviton, CAT5E 5G110-RW5  NO BID  $     3.250  $     3.500  $     3.530  $     3.320 
Blank Insert Modules, Leviton 41084-BWB  $       5.42  $     0.150  $     0.160  $     0.140  $     1.260 

Ladder Rack, 6" x 10', gray,  PFT SB-17-06-TG  NO BID  $   58.750  $   61.850  $   64.710  $   60.100 
J Bolt Kits, Beline SB-1003-J  NO BID  $     1.750  $     1.850  $     2.290  $     1.680 
7' Communication Racks, PFT, Aluminum SB-556-084-XU  NO BID  $ 105.000  $ 110.550  $ 138.820  $ 122.500 
6" Angle Bracket for ladder rack SB-2113-06-TG  NO BID  $     9.750  $   10.260  $   15.290  $     1.250 
19" Wire Management Panels WMB1  NO BID  $   25.820  $   25.450 
19" Wire Management Panels WMB2  $   28.000  $   29.500 
Vertical Wire Management VWMDS4X5BK7  NO BID  $ 120.000  $ 126.350  $ 138.820  $ 118.200 
48 Port Patch Panel 5G584-U48  NO BID  $ 162.000  $ 170.550  $ 212.940  $ 185.000 
Rack Mount Shelves RS-2  NO BID  $   28.000  $   24.500  $   75.290  $   31.550 
Electrical Tape, rolls Please provide  NO BID  $     0.500  $     0.540  $     0.590  $     0.650 
Pull String, bucket, G & B PL230-CP  NO BID  $   21.000  $   22.150  $   27.060  $   26.450 
11" BLACK UV cable tie, 1000pc/bag, 11" ALL RT1100UVC  NO BID  $   28.000  $   29.500  $   57.650  NO BID 
Write on cable labels, sheet, 1" TAG-22/5000PCS  NO BID  $ 105.000  $ 110.500  $ 184.710  $ 100.040 
3" D Ring Please provide  NO BID  $     0.800  $     0.850  $     1.470  $     1.070 
5" D Ring Please provide  NO BID  $     1.000  $     1.050  $     1.650  $     1.250 
Single Gang Device Box 1" Deep Please provide  NO BID  $     5.700  $     6.000  $     3.820  NO BID 
Single Gang Device Box 2 3/4" Deep Please provide  NO BID  $     7.250  $     7.650  $     4.410  NO BID 
RJ11 Phone Insert Please provide  NO BID  $     1.950  $     2.100  $     2.180  NO BID 
1" Plenum Innerduct Please provide  NO BID  $     1.600  $     1.700  $     2.035  NO BID 
2" Plenum Innerduct Please provide  NO BID  $     3.450  $     3.650  $     3.340  NO BID 
18" - 24"  Wall Mount Swing Out Rack Please provide  NO BID  $ 105.000  $ 110.550  $ 138.820  NO BID 
66 Block w/o connectors Please provide  NO BID  $     4.350  $     4.600  $     5.880  NO BID 
66 Block w/ connectors Please provide  NO BID  $   22.650  $   24.000  $   24.710  NO BID 
30 FT CAT5 Telco M/M Please provide  NO BID  $   77.250  $   82.000  $   95.290  NO BID 
Realtime Ethernet Tester RT-110BT  NO BID  $ 135.000  $ 142.100  $ 170.590  NO BID 


