
LEWISVILLE INDEPTENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
QUOTE #278-04 -NOTEBOOK BATTERIES

TABULATION

Models - Batteries
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HP Omnibook XE3 F2119WT  no bid 143.18$  135.00$  no bid no bid 118.00$  

HP Omnibook XE3 F3776WT no bid 143.18$  135.00$  no bid no bid 118.00$  

Compaq EVO N115 no bid no bid 155.00$  no bid no bid 141.00$  

Fujitsu C Series - C7651, C2111, 
C2210, C2230, C2240 no bid no bid no bid 85.00$  no bid 84.00$    

Acer TM242X no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid 147.00$  

Dell Inspiron 5000 & 8000 Series no bid 157.95$  no bid no bid 99.00$  144.00$  

Acer PC Tablets - all models no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid 155.00$  

Compaq PC Tablets - all models no bid no bid 106.00$  no bid no bid 131.00$  

Powerpad 80 $196.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

Powerpad 120 $259.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

Powerpad 160 $369.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

Valence VNC 65 $149.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

Valence VNC 130 $239.00 231.00$  no bid no bid no bid no bid
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