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Part # Part Description CDW-G DELL HITEQ M&A MSE  NET SIGMA AVAYA

J4850A HP ProCurve Switch 5304XL 1,350.00$    1,383.26$    1,215.05$    1,240.00$    1,241.48$    1,438.00$    1,279.00$    5,497.25$    
J4819A HP ProCurve Switch 5308XL 1,980.00$    2,075.36$    1,823.05$    1,862.00$    1,862.54$    2,157.00$    1,919.00$    5,497.25$    
J4849A HP ProCurve Switch 5348XL 3,200.00$    3,261.56$    2,893.70$    2,955.00$    2,955.59$    3,423.00$    3,046.00$    5,497.25$    
J4848A HP ProCurve Switch 5372XL 4,700.00$    4,930.00$    4,334.85$    4,427.00$    4,427.48$    5,070.00$    4,563.00$    5,497.25$    

H2893A/E 3 year, 4-hour onsite 24x7 for hardware 1,650.00$    NO BID 1,695.38$    2,131.00$    1,713.00$    1,842.00$    1,721.00$    4,500.00$    
H4496A/E 3 year, 4-hour onsite, 13x5 for hardware 1,350.00$    NO BID 1,376.08$    1,752.00$    1,415.00$    1,521.00$    1,415.00$    3,500.00$    

J4813A HP ProCurve Switch 2524 460.00$       420.00$       455.05$       402.00$       412.52$       528.00$       479.00$       NO BID
J4812A HP ProCurve Switch 2512 420.00$       420.00$       388.55$       403.00$       403.88$       450.00$       403.00$       NO BID

H5484A/E 3 year, 4-hour onsite, 13x5 for hardware 150.00$       342.00$       160.00$       189.00$       153.00$       166.00$       153.00$       NO BID

J4899A HP ProCurve Switch 2650 910.00$       550.00$       838.85$       885.00$       885.46$       977.00$       883.00$       NO BID
J8165A HP ProCurve Switch 2650 - PWR 3,200.00$    3,310.00$    2,978.25$    3,042.00$    3,042.25$    3,500.00$    3,135.00$    4,397.25$    
J4900A HP ProCurve Switch 2626 490.00$       420.00$       455.05$       480.00$       480.94$       531.00$       479.00$       NO BID
J8164A HP ProCurve Switch 2626 - PWR 1,750.00$    1,740.00$    1,579.85$    1,614.00$    1,614.12$    1,857.00$    1,663.00$    NO BID

H5481A/E 3 year, 4-hour onsite, 13x5 for hardware 550.00$       342.00$       558.26$       710.00$       574.00$       635.00$       574.00$       3,600.00$    

J8152A HP ProCurve Switch 4160gl 4,220.00$    4,380.00$    3,951.05$    4,173.00$    4,173.04$    4,643.00$    4,159.00$    NO BID
J4861A HP ProCurve Switch 4108gl bundle 3,500.00$    3,600.00$    3,179.65$    3,357.00$    2,835.00$    3,719.00$    3,347.00$    NO BID
J4865A HP ProCurve Switch 4108gl 1,450.00$    1,520.00$    1,336.65$    1,141.00$    1,411.99$    1,582.00$    1,407.00$    NO BID
J8151A HP ProCurve Switch 4140gl 2,950.00$    2,973.56$    2,674.25$    2,824.00$    2,824.62$    3,143.00$    2,815.00$    NO BID
J4888A HP ProCurve Switch 4148gl 1,570.00$    1,640.00$    1,446.85$    1,527.00$    1,527.57$    1,702.00$    1,523.00$    NO BID
J4887A HP ProCurve Switch 4104gl 970.00$       1,037.66$    911.05$       962.00$       962.52$       1,079.00$    959.00$       NO BID

H7675A/E 3 year, 4-hour onsite, 13x5 for hardware 1,670.00$    NO BID 1,524.40$    1,942.00$    1,568.00$    1,695.00$    1,568.00$    NO BID
H7676A/E 3 year, 4-hour onsite 24x7 for hardware 2,080.00$    NO BID 2,147.55$    2,700.00$    2,180.00$    2,371.00$    2,180.00$    NO BID
U2855A/E 3 year, 4-hour onsite, 13x5 for hardware 620.00$       NO BID 640.66$       805.00$       650.00$       703.00$       650.00$       NO BID
U2856A/E 3 year, 4-hour onsite 24x7 for hardware 870.00$       NO BID 904.34$       1,136.00$    918.00$       992.00$       918.00$       NO BID

J4139A HP ProCurve Routing Switch 9304m 5,670.00$    5,868.86$    5,155.65$    5,265.00$    5,265.91$    6,057.00$    5,427.00$    9,344.50$    
J4874A HP ProCurve Routing Switch 9315m NO BID 10,042.16$  8,682.05$    8,868.00$    8,868.01$    11,122.00$  9,139.00$    25,844.50$  
J4138A HP ProCurve Routing Switch 9308m NO BID NO BID 8,074.05$    8,246.00$    8,246.96$    9,540.00$    8,499.00$    9,894.50$    

H2885A/E 3 year, 4-hour onsite, 13x5 for hardware 12,200.00$  NO BID 12,111.77$  15,157.00$  12,240.00$  13,134.00$  12,240.00$  19,000.00$  
H2886A/E 3 year, 4-hour onsite 24x7 for hardware 15,220.00$  NO BID 15,141.00$  18,947.00$  15,273.00$  16,570.00$  15,300.00$  25,000.00$  
H2887A/E 3 year, 4-hour onsite, 13x5 for hardware NO BID NO BID 6,850.53$    8,526.00$    6,850.00$    7,449.00$    6,885.00$    28,000.00$  
H2888A/E 3 year, 4-hour onsite 24x7 for hardware NO BID NO BID NO BID 11,368.00$  9,201.00$    9,984.00$    9,180.00$    32,000.00$  

H7640PA/PE 1 year, post warranty, parts only NO BID NO BID 4,933.70$    6,205.00$    5,011.00$    5,421.00$    6,311.00$    NO BID
H7639PA/PE 1 year, post warranty, parts only NO BID NO BID 1,925.07$    3,173.00$    1,955.00$    2,115.00$    1,955.00$    NO BID
H2739PA/PE 1 year, post warranty, onsite 13x5 NO BID NO BID 6,213.99$    7,654.00$    6,311.00$    6,756.00$    6,311.00$    7,700.00$    
H2738PA/PE 1 year, post warranty, onsite 13x5 NO BID NO BID 2,406.08$    4,407.00$    2,444.00$    2,644.00$    3,634.00$    10,800.00$  

J8130A HP ProCurve Wireless AP 420 315.00$       389.00$       285.00$       285.00$       291.27$       337.00$       293.00$       NO BID
J8133A HP ProCurve Wireless AP 520 400.00$       397.76$       358.15$       358.00$       365.80$       417.00$       384.80$       NO BID
J8134A HP ProCurve Range Extender 95.00$         NO BID 84.55$         84.00$         78.00$         99.00$         77.00$         NO BID
J8135A HP ProCurve AP Card 150wl 80.00$         NO BID 72.20$         73.00$         69.00$         85.00$         66.00$         NO BID
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MODULES
J4820A HP ProCurve Switch XL 10/100 TX Module 24 port 1,550.00$       1,640.00$      1,446.85$     1,447.00$     1,477.48$      1,712.00$      1,523.00$      NO BID
J4821A HP ProCurve Switch XL 100/1000 T Module 4 port 720.00$          752.36$         667.85$       682.00$        682.96$         791.00$         703.00$         NO BID
J4878A HP ProCurve Switch XL Mini-GBIC Module 850.00$          890.00$         789.45$       806.00$        806.75$         934.00$         831.00$         4,397.25$      
J4852A HP ProCurve Switch XL 100 FX MTRJ Module 12 port 3,170.00$       3,195.86$      2,875.65$     2,936.00$     2,936.96$      3,345.00$      3,027.00$      NO BID
J8161A HP ProCurve Switch XL 10/100 TX POE Module NO BID
J4907A HP ProCurve Switch XL 16 port 10/100/1000 Module NO BID
J4908A HP ProCurve Switch gl 10/10/1000 Module 1,450.00$       1,485.86$      1,336.65$     1,411.00$     1,407.00$      1,571.00$      1,407.00$      NO BID
J4862B HP ProCurve Switch gl 10/100 TX Module 24 port 780.00$          827.96$         728.65$       769.00$        769.88$         858.00$         767.00$         NO BID
J4892A HP ProCurve Switch gl 100 FX MTRJ Module 1,860.00$       1,890.00$      1,708.10$     1,803.00$     1,803.67$      1,987.00$      1,798.00$      NO BID
J4863A HP ProCurve Switch gl 100/1000 T Module 680.00$          685.00$         607.05$       641.00$        641.46$         715.00$         639.00$         NO BID
J4893A HP ProCurve Switch gl Mini-GBIC Module 710.00$          752.36$         667.85$       705.00$        705.67$         791.00$         703.00$         NO BID
J4864A HP ProCurve Switch gl Transceiver Module 515.00$          552.56$         485.45$       512.00$        513.04$         575.00$         511.00$         NO BID
J4881A HP ProCurve 9300 EP 48 port 10/100 TX RJ45 Module 7,700.00$       8,080.00$      7,283.65$     7,438.00$     7,439.69$      8,665.00$      7,667.00$      5,222.25$      
J4885A HP ProCurve 9300 EP 8 port Mini-GBIC Red Mgt Module 10,400.00$     10,700.00$    9,654.85$     9,861.00$     9,861.69$      11,486.00$    10,163.00$    4,947.25$      
J4889A HP ProCurve 9300 EP 48 port 10/100 TX Telco Module NO BID NO BID 8,074.05$     8,246.00$     8,246.96$      9,595.00$      8,499.00$      10,447.25$    
J4894A HP ProCurve 9300 EP 16 port Mini-GBIC Module 1,390.00$       NO BID 12,305.35$   12,569.00$   12,569.48$    14,640.00$    12,953.00$    7,147.25$      
J4895A HP ProCurve 9300 EP 16 port 100/1000 T Module 8,250.00$       8,400.00$      7,599.05$     7,762.00$     7,762.54$      9,042.00$      7,999.00$      7,697.25$      
J8178A HP ProCurve 9300 EP 24 port 100Base FX Module 8,247.25$      
J8174A HP PrCurve 9300 2 port GbE Module 24,840.00$     NO BID 16,178.50$   16,525.00$   22,170.96$    19,009.00$    17,030.00$    16,497.25$    

MINI-GBICs
J4860A HP ProCurve Gigabit LH LC Mini-GBIC NO BID 3,900.56$      3,464.65$     3,538.00$     3,539.38$      4,095.00$      3,647.00$      3,297.25$      
J4859A HP ProCurve Gigabit LX LC Mini-GBIC NO BID 130.00$         644.10$       656.00$        657.69$         762.00$         678.00$         547.25$         
J4858A HP ProCurve Gigabit SX LC Mini-GBIC NO BID 40.00$           291.65$       297.00$        297.48$         343.00$         307.00$         272.25$         

TRANSCEIVERS
J4131B HP ProCurve Gigabit SX transceiver NO BID 291.56$         254.60$       269.00$        269.04$         300.00$         268.00$         272.25$         
J4132A HP ProCurve Gigabit LX transceiver NO BID 752.36$         667.85$       705.00$        705.47$         791.00$         703.00$         547.25$         
J4834A HP ProCurve 100/1000 T transceiver NO BID 268.00$         236.55$       249.00$        249.78$         279.00$         238.00$         2,747.25$      
J4853A HP ProCurve 100 FX SC transceiver NO BID 260.00$         230.85$       243.00$        243.36$         272.00$         243.00$         NO BID
J4116A HP ProCurve Gigabit stacking kit NO BID NO BID 151.05$       158.00$        159.88$         180.00$         159.00$         NO BID

RPS
J8168A HP ProCurve 600 Redundant and Ext Power Supply NO BID 300.00$         1,090.38$     1,055.00$     1,150.53$      1,214.00$      1,114.00$      162.25$         
J4839A HP ProCurve Switch RPS NO BID 760.46$         667.85$       682.00$        682.54$         786.00$         703.00$         NO BID
J4147A HP ProCurve 9304/9308 RPS NO BID 2,200.00$      1,933.25$     1,973.00$     1,974.33$      2,287.00$      2,035.00$      2,747.25$      
J4875A HP ProCurve 9315 RPS NO BID 3,645.00$      3,282.25$     3,352.00$     3,353.06$      4,206.00$      3,455.00$      2,747.25$      

PowerDsine PoE
PD-401/5 PoE Active Splitter NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 30.00$           105.00$         85.00$           NO BID
PD-6006 PoE Hub - 6 port NO BID 442.00$         NO BID NO BID 477.00$         616.00$         504.00$         478.40$         
PD-6012 PoE Hub - 12 port NO BID 620.00$         NO BID NO BID 671.00$         823.00$         706.00$         679.20$         
PD-6024 PoE Hub - 24 port NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 959.00$         NO BID NO BID NO BID

PRICING NOT AVAILABLE AT THIS TIME
PRICING NOT AVAILABLE AT THIS TIME

PRICING NOT AVAILABLE AT THIS TIME
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