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LEWISVILLE INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT 
CSP #1959-08 - 2008 RE-ROOFING PROJECT

(MARCUS HIGH SCHOOL, HEDRICK ELEMENTARY & MIDDLE SCHOOLS, COLLEGE STREET ELEMENTARY SCHOOL,
GRIFFIN MIDDLE SCHOOL, ETHRIDGE ELEMENTARY SCHOOL)

TABULATION

Marcus  Ethridge
High School Total Roof Products Square Elementary School Contingency Total Roof Products Square

Contractor Base Bid Contingency Cost Manufacturer Feet Base Bid Cost Manufacturer Feet
RoofMaster $112,350.00 $6,500.00 $118,850.00 Firestone 14,200 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Nations Roof NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $43,500.00 $5,000.00 $48,500.00 GAF 15,000
BRI $128,000.00 $6,500.00 $134,500.00 Carlise/Mansville 14,300 $48,000.00 $5,000.00 $53,000.00 GAF 17,000
Paragon NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Heritage One NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
AA Applicator NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Anchor NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Griffin  College Street  
Middle School Total Roof Products Square Elementary School Contingency Total Roof Products Square

Contractor Base Bid Contingency Cost Manufacturer Feet Base Bid Cost Manufacturer Feet
AA Applicators $1,008,523.00 $15,000.00 $1,023,523.00 Johns Manville 136,800 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
BRI $1,090,000.00 $15,000.00 $1,105,000.00 Soprema/Manville 137,700 $365,000.00 $15,000.00 $380,000.00 Soprema/Manville 34,500
Nations Roof Centra $1,244,000.00 $15,000.00 $1,259,000.00 Manville 133,800 $356,600.00 $15,000.00 $371,600.00 Manville 33,600
Paragon $1,328,799.00 $15,000.00 $1,343,799.00 Johns Manville 139,200 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Heritage One $1,350,000.00 $15,000.00 $1,365,000.00 Soprema/Firestone 132,860 $298,750.00 $15,000.00 $313,750.00 Soprema/Firestone 32,850
Anchor $1,450,000.00 $15,000.00 $1,465,000.00 Soprema 138,000 $415,000.00 $15,000.00 $430,000.00 Soprema 39,600
RoofMaster NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $363,700.00 $15,000.00 $378,700.00 Firestone 34,000

Hedrick  Alt Bid No. 1
Elementary School Total Roof Products Square Hedrick Middle School Contingency Total Roof Products Square

Contractor Base Bid Contingency Cost Manufacturer Feet Base Bid Cost Manufacturer Feet
Heritage One $565,000.00 $7,000.00 $572,000.00 Soprema/Firestone 65,360 $579,000.00 $7,000.00 $586,000.00 Soprema/Firestone 67,850
Anchor Roofing $700,000.00 $7,000.00 $707,000.00 Soprema 66,000 $870,000.00 $7,000.00 $877,000.00 Soprema 80,000
BRI NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Paragon NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
AA Applicators NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
RoofMaster NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Nations Roof NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
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