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LEWISVILLE INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
CSP #1944-08 - 2008 RENOVATIONS TO ADMINISTRATION BUILDING, LEWISVILLE HIGH SCHOOL, AND HEDRICK ELEMENTARY SCHOOL

TABULATION

ADMIN ROOF SCREEN ADMIN LHS HEDRICK ES HOT WATER SAN SEWER HEDRICK TILE - $/SF TERR -$/SF
Contractor HVAC ALT 1A TOTAL BASE BID BASE BID ALT 1B ALT2B TOTAL ALT 3B ALT 3B

CBS Mechanical 1,269,000.00$  69,000.00$        1,338,000.00$  164,000.00$  349,000.00$              29,500.00$            6,200.00$           384,700.00$ 11.00$        23.00$        

Hisaw & Associates 1,378,000.00$  60,000.00$        1,438,000.00$  224,000.00$  315,000.00$              18,000.00$            2,000.00$           335,000.00$ 10.00$        22.00$        

John Cook & Associ 1,138,240.00$  59,000.00$        1,197,240.00$  144,500.00$  NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

TDR Contractors 1,168,000.00$  68,000.00$        1,236,000.00$  NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Joe Funk GC 1,885,000.00$  54,000.00$        1,939,000.00$  170,000.00$  236,000.00$              21,000.00$            6,375.00$           263,375.00$ 8.00$          25.20$        
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