
Lewisville ISD
CSP #1883-07 - 2007 Re-Roofing Project

Creekside and Flower Mound Elementary Schools Select Areas
TABULATION

Creekside  Flower Mound Alternate #1
Elementary Total Roof Products Square Elementary Contingency Total Roof Products Square Include Roof Area H

Contractor Base Bid Contingency Cost Manufacturer Feet Base Bid Cost Manufacturer Feet Add
Supreme $175,195.00 $10,000.00 $185,195.00 Tamko 75,000 $875,210.00 $15,000 $890,210.00 Soprema 74,700 $57,600.00
BRI $180,000.00 $10,000.00 $190,000.00 GAF 67,900 $605,000.00 $15,000 $620,000.00 Soprema 80,200 $70,000.00
Castro $217,500.00 $10,000.00 $227,500.00 Tamko 82,000 $483,000.00 $15,000 $498,000.00 Soprema 73,500 $51,000.00
J. Reynolds $370,390.00 $10,000.00 $380,390.00 Tamko 86,955 $467,590.00 $15,000 $482,590.00 JM 79,950 $54,820.00
Paragon $166,185.00 $10,000.00 $176,185.00 JM 94,000 $431,500.00 $15,000 $446,500.00 JM 73,800 NO ADD
Heritage One NO BID $10,000.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $434,000.00 $15,000 $449,000.00 Soprema 76,800 $52,300.00
J&J NO BID $10,000.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $514,500.00 $15,000 $529,500.00 Soprema 77,000 $64,750.00
Advantage NO BID $10,000.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $589,000.00 $15,000 $604,000.00 JM 71,400 $60,000.00
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