
LEWISVILLE INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
CSP #1867-07 - INTERACTIVE TECHNOLOGY EQUIPMENT

TABULATION

ITEM
 # DESCRIPTION

System 
Unit Price

(1 - 50)
(w/ Mfg 

Warranty)

System 
Unit Price

(1 - 50)
(w/ 3 yr 

Warranty)

System 
Unit Price

(1 - 50)
(w/ Mfg 

Warranty)

System 
Unit Price

(1 - 50)
(w/ 3 yr 

Warranty)

System 
Unit Price

(1 - 50)
(w/ Mfg 

Warranty)

System 
Unit Price

(1 - 50)
(w/ 3 yr 

Warranty)

System 
Unit Price

(1 - 50)
(w/ Mfg 

Warranty)

System 
Unit Price

(1 - 50)
(w/ 3 yr 

Warranty)

System 
Unit Price

(1 - 50)
(w/ Mfg 

Warranty)

System 
Unit Price

(1 - 50)
(w/ 3 yr 

Warranty)

System 
Unit Price

(1 - 50)
(w/ Mfg 

Warranty)

System 
Unit Price

(1 - 50)
(w/ 3 yr 

Warranty)
Section 1: INTERACTIVE WHITE BOARDS

per Specification 1.(a)

1 60" White Board  596.00/
1507.00 

 596.00/
1507.00 NB NB 1,116.00    1,336.00        1119.00/1-19

1071.00/20-49
 1119.00/1-19
1071.00/20-49 NB NB NB NB

1(a) Stand for 60"  243.00/
569.00 

 243.00/
569.00 NB NB 335.00       NB 349.00        349.00        NB NB NB NB

2 64" White Board  674.00/
1640.00 

 674.00/
1640.00 1,299.00  NB NB NB  1119.00/1-19

1071.00/20-49
 1119.00/1-19
1071.00/20-49 NB NB 1,302.00   1,302.00   

2(a) Stand for 64"  266.00/
608.00 

 266.00/
608.00 475.00     NB NB NB 349.00        349.00        NB NB 432.00      N/A

3 72" White Board  680.00/
2172.00 

 680.00/
2172.00 1,678.00  NB 1,299.00    1,595.00        1399.00/1-19

1339.00/20-49
 1399.00/1-19
1339.00/20-49 N/A 1,345.00   1,940.00   1,940.00   

3(a) Stand for 72"  266.00/
614.00 

 266.00/
614.00 475.00     NB 335.00       NB 349.00        349.00        N/A 409.00      432.00      N/A

4 Bluetooth Wireless Option  125.00/
375.00 

 125.00/
375.00 179.00     NB  SEE

ATTACHMENT 
 SEE

ATTACHMENT 199.00        199.00        INCLUDED INCLUDED 204.00      N/A

5 (%) Discount from list price for additional items not listed 10% 10% 5% NB  SEE
ATTACHMENT 

 SEE
ATTACHMENT 25% 25% SPECIAL 

PRICING
SPECIAL 
PRICING NB NB

Section 2: WIRELESS INTERACTIVE TABLETS/PADS
per Specification 1.(b)

1 Wireless Interactive Tablet/Pad NB NB NB NB 445.00       495.00          399.00        399.00        N/A 445.00      429.00      N/A

2 Bluetooth Wireless Option w/ USB NB NB NB NB 89.00         NB INCLUDED INCLUDED N/A INCLUDED INCL N/A

3 (%) Discount from list price for additional items not listed NB NB NB NB  SEE
ATTACHMENT 

 SEE
ATTACHMENT 25% 25% SPECIAL 

PRICING
SPECIAL 
PRICING NB NB

Section 3: INTERACTIVE STUDENT RESPONSE 
SYSTEMS

per Specification 1.(c)
 

1 16 Pad - Interactive Student Response System NB NB NB NB 1,125.00    NB NB NB NB NB NB NB

2 24 Pad - Interactive Student Response System NB NB NB NB 1,550.00    NB NB NB NB NB NB NB

3
32 Pad - Interactive Student Response System NB NB NB NB 1,887.00    NB NB NB N/A 1,695.00   NB NB

4 IR Option NB NB NB NB
 SEE

ATTACHMENT 
 SEE

ATTACHMENT NB NB NB NB NB NB

5 RF Option NB NB NB NB
 SEE

ATTACHMENT 
 SEE

ATTACHMENT NB NB INCLUDED INCLUDED NB NB

6 Numerical Pad and Text Entry Option NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB

7 (%) Discount from list price for additional items not listed NB NB NB NB  SEE
ATTACHMENT 

 SEE
ATTACHMENT NB NB NB NB NB NB

Section 4: DOCUMENT CAMERAS
per Specification 1.(d)       515.00 515.00      

1 AverVision 130 or equivalent 375.00      375.00      411.00     NB 475.00       NB 595.00        595.00        N/A 543.99      NB NB

CDW GOVERNMENT COMPUTER TECH CYTEK MEDIA SYSTEMS DATA PROJECTIONS DELL
DESIGNS THAT 

COMPUTE
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LEWISVILLE INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
CSP #1867-07 - INTERACTIVE TECHNOLOGY EQUIPMENT

TABULATION

ITEM
 # DESCRIPTION

Section 1: INTERACTIVE WHITE BOARDS
per Specification 1.(a)

1 60" White Board

1(a) Stand for 60"

2 64" White Board

2(a) Stand for 64"

3 72" White Board

3(a) Stand for 72"

4 Bluetooth Wireless Option

5 (%) Discount from list price for additional items not listed

Section 2: WIRELESS INTERACTIVE TABLETS/PADS
per Specification 1.(b)

1 Wireless Interactive Tablet/Pad

2 Bluetooth Wireless Option w/ USB

3 (%) Discount from list price for additional items not listed

Section 3: INTERACTIVE STUDENT RESPONSE 
SYSTEMS

per Specification 1.(c)
1 16 Pad - Interactive Student Response System

2 24 Pad - Interactive Student Response System

3
32 Pad - Interactive Student Response System

4 IR Option

5 RF Option

6 Numerical Pad and Text Entry Option

7 (%) Discount from list price for additional items not listed

Section 4: DOCUMENT CAMERAS
per Specification 1.(d)

1 AverVision 130 or equivalent

System 
Unit Price

(1 - 50)
(w/ Mfg 

Warranty)

System 
Unit Price

(1 - 50)
(w/ 3 yr 

Warranty)

System 
Unit Price

(1 - 50)
(w/ Mfg 

Warranty)

System 
Unit Price

(1 - 50)
(w/ 3 yr 

Warranty)

System 
Unit Price

(1 - 50)
(w/ Mfg 

Warranty)

System 
Unit Price

(1 - 50)
(w/ 3 yr 

Warranty)

System 
Unit Price

(1 - 50)
(w/ Mfg 

Warranty)

System 
Unit Price

(1 - 50)
(w/ 3 yr 

Warranty)

System 
Unit Price

(1 - 50)
(w/ Mfg 

Warranty)

System 
Unit Price

(1 - 50)
(w/ 3 yr 

Warranty)

NB NB NB NB 1,286.50   1,428.00     1,453.06   1,453.06     NB NB

NB NB NB NB 280.00      NB 555.10      555.10        NB NB

NB NB NB NB NB NB 1,608.16   1,608.16     NB NB

NB NB NB NB NB NB 591.89      591.89        NB NB

NB NB 1,279.00   1,279.00   1,456.50   1,618.00     2,092.86   2,092.83     NB NB

NB NB 485.00      485.00      280.00      NB 621.43      621.30        NB NB

NB NB 225.00      225.00      351.00      NB 365.31      365.31        NB NB

NB NB UP TO 40% UP TO 40% 0-30% 0-30% 20% 20% NB NB

265.00      NB 349.00      349.00      400.00      490.00        280.61      280.61        NB NB

NB NB INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED NB NB

10% 10% UP TO 40% UP TO 40% 0-30% 0-30% 12% 12% NB NB

995.00      SEE #12 NB NB 980.00      1,088.00     1,742.36   1,742.36     NB NB
995.00/
1495.00 SEE #12 NB NB 1,330.00   1,477.00     1,595.15   1,595.15     NB NB

 1250.00/
1995.00 SEE #12 NB NB 1,680.00   1,866.00     2,046.59   2,046.59     NB NB

NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB

NB NB NB NB INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED NB NB

NB NB NB NB INCLUDED INCLUDED 65.56        65.56          NB NB

10% 10% UP TO 40% UP TO 40% 0-30% 0-30% 10% 10% NB NB

NB NB 549.00      549.00      450.00      NB 388.42      388.42        401.73      401.73      

MASTER AUDIO
VISUALS

TROXELL
COMMUNICATIONS VALIANT IMCEINSTRUCTION M&A TECHNOLOGY
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LEWISVILLE INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
CSP #1867-07 - INTERACTIVE TECHNOLOGY EQUIPMENT

TABULATION

ITEM
 # DESCRIPTION

System 
Unit Price

(1 - 50)
(w/ Mfg 

Warranty)

System 
Unit Price

(1 - 50)
(w/ 3 yr 

Warranty)

System 
Unit Price

(1 - 50)
(w/ Mfg 

Warranty)

System 
Unit Price

(1 - 50)
(w/ 3 yr 

Warranty)

System 
Unit Price

(1 - 50)
(w/ Mfg 

Warranty)

System 
Unit Price

(1 - 50)
(w/ 3 yr 

Warranty)

System 
Unit Price

(1 - 50)
(w/ Mfg 

Warranty)

System 
Unit Price

(1 - 50)
(w/ 3 yr 

Warranty)

System 
Unit Price

(1 - 50)
(w/ Mfg 

Warranty)

System 
Unit Price

(1 - 50)
(w/ 3 yr 

Warranty)

System 
Unit Price

(1 - 50)
(w/ Mfg 

Warranty)

System 
Unit Price

(1 - 50)
(w/ 3 yr 

Warranty)

CDW GOVERNMENT COMPUTER TECH CYTEK MEDIA SYSTEMS DATA PROJECTIONS DELL
DESIGNS THAT 

COMPUTE

2 AverVision 300P or equivalent 546.00      546.00      575.00     NB 690.00       NB 615.00        615.00        N/A 393.99      NB NB

3 (%) Discount from list price for additional items not listed 0-40% 0-40% 5% 5% SEE
ATTACHMENT

SEE
ATTACHMENT

25% 25% SPECIAL 
PRICING

SPECIAL 
PRICING NB NB

Section 5: DIGITAL PROJECTORS
per Specification 1.(e)

1 1600 lumens minimum or equivalent, including 1 each 
replacement bulb 695.00      695.00      774.00     NB 775.00       935.00          NB NB 781.96      782.95      NB NB

2 2000 lumens minimum or equivalent with 5 W monaural 
speakers, including 1 each replacement bulb       905.00 905.00            990.00 NB        995.00 1,155.00             1,221.00 1,221.00           893.95 905.95       NB NB

3 Replacement Bulbs for 1600 lumens projector 159.00      159.00      159.00     NB 206.00       NB NB NB 159.00      N/A NB NB

4 Replacement Bulbs for 2000 lumens projector, with 5 W 
monaural speakers 250.00      250.00      241.00     NB 283.00       NB 275.00        NB 159.00      N/A NB NB

5 (%) Discount from list price for additional items not listed 0-40% 0-40% 10% 10% SEE
ATTACHMENT

SEE
ATTACHMENT

25% 25% SPECIAL 
PRICING

SPECIAL 
PRICING NB NB

Section 6:  VIDEO PROCESSOR/SWITCHER
per Specification 1.(f)

1 ViewSonic NextVision N4 or equivalent 135.00      NB 151.00     NB 165.00       NB NB NB NB NB NB NB

2 (%) Discount from list price for additional items not listed 0-40% 0-40% 5% 5% NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB
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LEWISVILLE INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
CSP #1867-07 - INTERACTIVE TECHNOLOGY EQUIPMENT

TABULATION

ITEM
 # DESCRIPTION

2 AverVision 300P or equivalent

3 (%) Discount from list price for additional items not listed

Section 5: DIGITAL PROJECTORS
per Specification 1.(e)

1 1600 lumens minimum or equivalent, including 1 each 
replacement bulb

2 2000 lumens minimum or equivalent with 5 W monaural 
speakers, including 1 each replacement bulb

3 Replacement Bulbs for 1600 lumens projector

4 Replacement Bulbs for 2000 lumens projector, with 5 W 
monaural speakers

5 (%) Discount from list price for additional items not listed

Section 6:  VIDEO PROCESSOR/SWITCHER
per Specification 1.(f)

1 ViewSonic NextVision N4 or equivalent

2 (%) Discount from list price for additional items not listed

System 
Unit Price

(1 - 50)
(w/ Mfg 

Warranty)

System 
Unit Price

(1 - 50)
(w/ 3 yr 

Warranty)

System 
Unit Price

(1 - 50)
(w/ Mfg 

Warranty)

System 
Unit Price

(1 - 50)
(w/ 3 yr 

Warranty)

System 
Unit Price

(1 - 50)
(w/ Mfg 

Warranty)

System 
Unit Price

(1 - 50)
(w/ 3 yr 

Warranty)

System 
Unit Price

(1 - 50)
(w/ Mfg 

Warranty)

System 
Unit Price

(1 - 50)
(w/ 3 yr 

Warranty)

System 
Unit Price

(1 - 50)
(w/ Mfg 

Warranty)

System 
Unit Price

(1 - 50)
(w/ 3 yr 

Warranty)

MASTER AUDIO
VISUALS

TROXELL
COMMUNICATIONS VALIANT IMCEINSTRUCTION M&A TECHNOLOGY

NB NB 549.00      549.00      589.00      NB 542.67      542.67        558.00      558.00      

NB NB UP TO 40% UP TO 40% 0-30% 0-30% 15% 15% 9% 9%

NB NB 1,089.00   1,089.00   NB NB 719.34      719.34        838.36      838.36      

 NB NB    1,445.00 1,445.00         970.00 NB       775.46 775.46              916.67 916.67      

NB NB 249.00      N/A NB NB 153.01      153.01        NB 270.02      

NB NB 371.00      N/A 289.00      NB 153.01      153.01        NB 313.30      

NB NB UP TO 40% UP TO 40% 0-30% 0-30% 16-20% 16-20% 19% 19%

NB NB 159.00      N/A 85.00        NB 147.80      NB NB NB

NB NB UP TO 40% UP TO 40% 0-30% 0-30% 5% 5% NB NB
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ITEM
 # DESCRIPTION

System 
Unit Price

(1 - 50)
(w/ Mfg 

Warranty)

System 
Unit Price

(1 - 50)
(w/ 3 yr 

Warranty)

System 
Unit Price

(1 - 25)
(w/ Mfg 

Warranty)

System 
Unit Price

(1 - 50)
(w/ 5 yr 

Warranty)

System Unit 
Price (26-50) 

(w/MFG 
warranty

System Unit 
Price (26-50 

) (w/5 yr 
warranty)

System 
Unit Price

(1 - 50)
(w/ Mfg 

Warranty)

System 
Unit Price

(1 - 50)
(w/ 3 yr 

Warranty)

System 
Unit Price

(1 - 50)
(w/ Mfg 

Warranty)

System 
Unit Price

(1 - 50)
(w/ 3 yr 

Warranty)

System 
Unit Price

(1 - 50)
(w/ Mfg 

Warranty)

System 
Unit Price

(1 - 50)
(w/ 3 yr 

Warranty)
Section 1: INTERACTIVE WHITE 

BOARDS
per Specification 1.(a)

1 60" White Board  596.00 w/ 5 
year warranty

Standard is 5 
year warranty        1,095.00        1,160.00        1,055.00        1,110.00 NB NB NB NB $1,252.00 $1,252.00 

1(a) Stand for 60"
 243.00 w/ 

5year 
warranty 

Standard is 5 
year warranty           325.00           325.00           325.00           325.00 NB NB NB NB $479.00 $479.00 

2 64" White Board  674.00 w/ 5 
year warranty

Standard is 5 
year warranty  no bid  no bid  no bid  no bid        1,019.00        1,019.00 NB NB $1,252.00 $1,252.00 

2(a) Stand for 64"
 266.00 w/ 

5year 
warranty 

Standard is 5 
year warranty  no bid  no bid  no bid  no bid           319.00           319.00 NB NB $479.00 $479.00 

3 72" White Board  680.00 w/ 5 
year warranty

Standard is 5 
year warranty        1,255.00        1,295.00        1,215.00        1,255.00        1,289.00        1,289.00 N/A 1,345.00      $1,252.00 $1,252.00 

3(a) Stand for 72"
 266.00 w/ 

5year 
warranty 

Standard is 5 
year warranty           325.00           325.00           325.00           325.00           319.00           319.00 N/A 409.00         $479.00 $479.00 

Option 77" whiteboard  N/A  N/A 1,315.00      1,375.00      1,275.00      1,335.00       N/A  N/A  N/A  N/A  N/A  N/A 
77" Whiteboard with built in bluetooth  N/A  N/A 1,540.00      1,599.00      1,500.00      1,559.00       N/A  N/A  N/A  N/A  N/A  N/A 

4 Bluetooth Wireless Option

 Add an 
additional 

$125.00 to 
board 

Standard is 5 
year warranty           385.00           385.00           385.00           385.00           179.00           179.00 INCLUDED INCLUDED $223.00 $223.00 

5 Optional Train the Trainer Per Day Pricing 
(if not included in unit prices above).        1,475.00        1,530.00        1,435.00        1,490.00 Included Included $2,500.00 $2,500.00 

1 Day Free; 
$600 each 

add'l day

1 Day Free; 
$600 each 

add'l day

6 (%) Discount from list price for additional item 10% 10% various various various various 25% 25% SPECIAL 
PRICING

SPECIAL 
PRICING Up to 40% Up to 40%

**Cytek Note:
InterWrite is offering a "Seed Program" for any school not currently in posession of an InterWrite Interactive Board.  The school can purchase one 77" WhiteBoard Model 1077 for $799. 
 This is not a Bluetooth model - there is an additional charge to make it Bluetooth wireless.

**Cytek

CSP #1867-07 - INTERACTIVE TECHNOLOGY EQUIPMENT
BEST AND FINAL OFFER

SECTION 1

DELLCDW-G M & AData Projections
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ITEM
 # DESCRIPTION

System 
Unit Price

(1 - 50)
(w/ Mfg 

Warranty)

System 
Unit Price

(1 - 50)
(w/ 3 yr 

Warranty)

System 
Unit Price

(1 - 50)
(w/ Mfg 

Warranty)

System 
Unit Price

(1 - 50)
(w/ 3 yr 

Warranty)

System 
Unit Price

(1 - 50)
(w/ Mfg 

Warranty)

System 
Unit Price

(1 - 50)
(w/ 3 yr 

Warranty)

System 
Unit Price

(1 - 50)
(w/ Mfg 

Warranty)

System 
Unit Price

(1 - 50)
(w/ 5 yr 

Warranty)

System 
Unit Price

(1 - 50)
(w/ Mfg 

Warranty)

System 
Unit Price

(1 - 50)
(w/ 3 yr 

Warranty)
Section 2: WIRELESS INTERACTIVE TABLETS/PADS

per Specification 1.(b)

1 Wireless Interactive Tablet/Pad $434 $475 349.00        249.00         265.00        NB $347.00 $347.00 $280.61 N/A

2 Bluetooth Wireless Option w/ USB 89.00         NB No Charge No Charge NB NB Included Included INCLUDED 
ABOVE 

INCLUDED 
ABOVE 

3 (%) Discount from list price for additional items not listed  various  various 25% 25% 10% 10%  Up to 40%  Up to 40% 

 12% OFF LIST 
ON HITACHI 

INTERACTIVE 
PADS 

 12% OFF LIST 
ON HITACHI 

INTERACTIVE 
PADS 

M & A

CSP #1867-07 - INTERACTIVE TECHNOLOGY EQUIPMENT
BEST AND FINAL OFFER

SECTION 2

eInstructionCytek TroxellData Projections
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ITEM
 # DESCRIPTION

System 
Unit Price

(1 - 50)
(w/ Mfg 

Warranty)

System 
Unit Price

(1 - 50)
(w/ 3 yr 

Warranty)

System 
Unit Price

(1 - 50)
(w/ Mfg 

Warranty)

System 
Unit Price

(1 - 50)
(w/ 3 yr 

Warranty)

System 
Unit Price

(1 - 50)
(w/ Mfg 

Warranty)

System 
Unit Price

(1 - 50)
(w/ 3 yr 

Warranty)
Section 3: INTERACTIVE STUDENT RESPONSE 

SYSTEMS
per Specification 1.(c)

1 16 Pad - Interactive Student Response System NB NB 995.00    SEE #12 $980.00 $1,210.00

2 24 Pad - Interactive Student Response System NB NB
995.00/

1495.00 SEE #12 $1,330.00 $1,750.00

3 32 Pad - Interactive Student Response System N/A 1,695.00   
1250.00/
1995.00 SEE #12 $1,690.00 $2,220.00

4 IR Option NB NB NB NB $1,375.00 $1,743.00 

5 RF Option INCLUDED INCLUDED NB NB NB NB

6 Numerical Pad and Text Entry Option NB NB NB NB NB NB

7 (%) Discount from list price for additional items not listed NB NB 10% 10% varies varies

CSP #1867-07 - INTERACTIVE TECHNOLOGY EQUIPMENT
BEST AND FINAL OFFER

SECTION 3

Cytek MediaeInstructionDELL
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ITEM
 # DESCRIPTION

System 
Unit Price

(1 - 50)
(w/ Mfg 

Warranty)

System 
Unit Price

(1 - 50)
(w/ 3 yr 

Warranty)

System 
Unit Price

(1 - 50)
(w/ Mfg 

Warranty)

System 
Unit Price

(1 - 50)
(w/ 3 yr 

Warranty)

System 
Unit Price

(1 - 50)
(w/ Mfg 

Warranty)

System 
Unit Price

(1 - 50)
(w/ 3 yr 

Warranty)
Section 4: DOCUMENT CAMERAS

per Specification 1.(d)

1 AverVision 130 or equivalent $375.00
Standard 5 year 

warranty $603.75 $603.75 $388.42 $388.42

2

AverVision 300P or equivalent

$546.00 or 
$469.00w/ 

quantities of 100 
or more 

Standard 5 year 
warranty 579.60                579.60             $542.67 $542.67

3 Microscope Adapter (if not included in price above).
31.90 / 

VISION3NMA
Standard 5 year 

warranty 53 53.00               $37.30 $37.30

4 (%) Discount from list price for additional items not liste 0-40% 0-40% 25% 25%

15% off List on 
Avermedia 
Document 
Cameras

15% off List on 
Avermedia 
Document 
Cameras

CSP #1867-07 - INTERACTIVE TECHNOLOGY EQUIPMENT
BEST AND FINAL OFFER

SECTION 4

CDW-G Data Projections Troxell
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ITEM
 # DESCRIPTION

System 
Unit Price

(1 - 50)
(w/ Mfg 

Warranty)

System 
Unit Price

(1 - 50)
(w/ 3 yr 

Warranty)

System 
Unit Price

(1 - 50)
(w/ Mfg 

Warranty)

System 
Unit Price

(1 - 50)
(w/ 3 yr 

Warranty)

System 
Unit Price

(1 - 50)
(w/ Mfg 

Warranty)

System 
Unit Price

(1 - 50)
(w/ 3 yr 

Warranty)
Section 5: DIGITAL PROJECTORS

per Specification 1.(e)

1 1600 lumens minimum or equivalent, including 1 each 
replacement bulb 695.00            na 781.96            782.95            719.34$          719.34$          

2 2000 lumens minimum or equivalent with 5 W monaural 
speakers, including 1 each replacement bulb             905.00 na             893.95 905.95            749.95$          749.95$          

3 Replacement Bulbs for 1600 lumens projector 145.00            na 159.00            N/A 153.01$          na

4 Replacement Bulbs for 2000 lumens projector, with 5 W 
monaural speakers 230.00            na 159.00            N/A  $         153.01 na 

5 (%) Discount from list price for additional items not listed 0-40% na SPECIAL 
PRICING

SPECIAL 
PRICING 20% 20%

CDW-G

CSP #1867-07 - INTERACTIVE TECHNOLOGY EQUIPMENT
BEST AND FINAL OFFER

SECTION 5

TroxellDELL
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ITEM
 # DESCRIPTION

System 
Unit Price

(1 - 50)
(w/ Mfg 

Warranty)

System 
Unit Price

(1 - 50)
(w/ 3 yr 

Warranty)

System 
Unit Price

(1 - 50)
(w/ Mfg 

Warranty)

System 
Unit Price

(1 - 50)
(w/ 3 yr 

Warranty)
Section 6:  VIDEO PROCESSOR/SWITCHER

per Specification 1.(f)

1 ViewSonic NextVision N4 or equivalent
$85.00 / Steren 

203-250 n/a
$135.00 / AVERMEDIA TVBOX9 EXT TV 
TUNE RES** 1year limited warranty n/a

2 (%) Discount from list price for additional items not listed 0-30% 0-40%

CSP #1867-07 - INTERACTIVE TECHNOLOGY EQUIPMENT
BEST AND FINAL OFFER

SECTION 6

CDW-GMaster Audio Visual
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